
    

 
 

     
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

31
st
 May 2019 

 
 
Dear Applicant 
  
Further to your Freedom of Information request, this has now been considered and the information 
requested is provided below. 
  
FOI Reference Number: FOI190508 

 

Date FOI Received: 13/5/19 
Date Response due:  11/6/19 
Subject: Assessing variation in Axial 

Spondyloarthritis Services 
  
NHS East and North Hertfordshire CCG’s response is:  
  
  
 Recognition and Referral 

1. Does your CCG have a specified pathway from primary care to secondary care for 

inflammatory back pain in place? 

Please select one of the following response options 

 Yes 

 No 
 

If you answered ‘yes’, please give details below of the pathway and, if applicable, 
arrangements in place to raise awareness in primary care 
 
N/A 
 
If neither of the above response options apply to you, please provide more information on 
your local arrangements below 
 
N/A  

 
Diagnosis in specialist care settings 

2. What is the average current waiting time to diagnosis for a patient referred with inflammatory 

back pain? 
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 The CCG does not hold information on the waiting time for patients with inflammatory 
 back pain.  
 

3. Are patients with suspected axial SpA (AS) routinely referred for a full spinal MRI? 

Please select one of the following response options 

 Yes 

 No 
 If neither of the above response options apply to you, please provide more information on 
 your local arrangements below 
  
 As the CCG does not have a specific pathway for inflammatory back pain, there are no 
 specific requirements on imaging. The local Trusts would have this information.  

 
Information and Support 

4. How do you ensure patients are given information and support following their diagnosis? 

Please select whichever response options apply 
 
 As the CCG does not have a specific pathway for inflammatory back pain, there are no 
 specific requirements on patient information. The local Trusts would have this 
 information.  

 
Pharmacological management of axial SpA (AS) 

5. What guidance are patients with axial SpA (AS) given when deciding whether to access 

biologic treatment?  

Please provide details of arrangements in your local area below 

 

As with all drug treatments, the expectation is that the specialist and patient share 

decision making about appropriate treatment options, taking into account the risks and 

benefits of treatment and patient values and preferences. The applicant would need to 

liaise with provider specialists to confirm specific guidance patients are given when 

deciding whether to access biologic treatment. 

 

6. Bearing in mind the NICE anti TNF guidance for ankylosing spondylitis (TA383) states that, 
‘Treatment with another anti TNF is recommended for people who cannot tolerate, or whose 
disease has not responded to, treatment with the first TNF-alpha inhibitor, or whose disease 
has stopped responding after an initial response’, after failure with one biologic,  how many 
other biologics will your commissioners fund a patient with axial SpA (AS) to try, including IL 
17As?   
Please select one of the following response options : None, 1, 2, 3 or more. 
If none of the above response options apply to you, please provide more information on your 
local arrangements below 
 
NHS East and North Hertfordshire CCG commission biologics for the treatment of 
ankylosing spondylitis and non-radiographic axial spondyloarthritis in accordance 
with relevant NICE Technology Appraisals and local commissioning recommendations. 
Commissioning recommendations are available on the ENHCCG website at 
https://www.enhertsccg.nhs.uk/musculoskeletal-and-joint-disease .  
 

Non-pharmacological management of axial SpA 

7. What proportion of adults with axial SpA (AS) are referred to a specialist physiotherapist for a 

structured exercise programme within your local area when first diagnosed? 

             Please provide details below 
 
 The CCG does not hold data on the number or proportion of adults with axial SpA that 
 are referred to a specialist physiotherapist.  The local Trusts would have this 
 information.  
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Flare management 

8.  What percentage of patients with axial SpA (AS) have a written care plan to support them with 
 a flare? 
 
 The CCG does not hold data on the number or proportion of patients with axial SpA 
 that have a written care plan for the management of a flare. The local Trusts would 
 have this information.  

 

Organisation of care 

9.  Does the Trust have a dedicated axial SpA (AS) clinic? 

 No, Please contact ENHCCG’s main acute providers to clarify whether the Trusts have 
 a dedicated axial SpA (AS) clinic.  ENHCCG’s main acute providers are East and North 
 Hertfordshire NHS Trust, Princess Alexandra Hospital NHS Trust and the Royal Free 
 NHS Foundation Trust.  
 Please contact ENHCCG’s main acute providers to clarify whether the Trusts have a 
 dedicated axial SpA (AS) clinic.  ENHCCG’s main acute providers are East and North 
 Hertfordshire NHS Trust, Princess Alexandra Hospital NHS Trust and the Royal Free 
 NHS Foundation Trust.  

 
Mental health and well being 

10. Are axial SpA (AS) patients under the care of a rheumatologist offered access to 

psychological services? 

 ENHCCG does not hold this information, please contact ENHCCG’s main acute 
 providers to clarify whether the Trusts have a dedicated clinic and if so, whether axial 
 SpA (AS) patients are under the care of a rheumatologist and offered access to 
 psychological services 
  
  
Please note that the information provided remains the property of NHS East and North Hertfordshire 
CCG and is therefore subject to Intellectual Property and Database Rights. In view of the Re-use of 
Public Sector Information Regulations, should you wish to re-use this information for commercial 
reasons, you are advised to obtain permission from us. Agreement to use the information for commercial 
reasons may incur a fee as the information is issued under licence. If you have any questions about the 
process, please do not hesitate to contact us in the first instance at: enhertsccg.information@nhs.net   
  
If you are dissatisfied with this response or wish to appeal, you may write to: 
Company Secretary 
Governance & Corporate Affairs 
NHS East and North Hertfordshire CCG 
Charter House 
Parkway 
Welwyn Garden City 
AL8 6JL.  
  
Alternatively, you may appeal to the Information Commissioner whose contact details are available at 
http://www.ico.org.uk 
  
Yours sincerely 
  
 

 
  
Freedom of Information Lead 
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